Fwd: 128-0798-964; Insurance Complaint 298521

Subject: Fwd: 128-0798-964; Insurance Complaint 298521
From: Peter Pfeiffer <pcpfeiffer@msn.com>

Date: 2/26/2025, 2:24 PM

To: <shawna.bailey@state.co.us>

Ms. Bailey,

Thank you so much for your recent email. | have more information to upload to the D.O.R.A. site
(e.g., texts, even after opting out) and | understand I'll see a response there and | can study your
guidelines and timetable. | wanted to forward this ASAP. And | wanted to tell them strongly yet

politely again to please stop.

In terms of evidence, this was referenced but | wanted to provide this link at my blog again:

https://pcpfeiffer.org/different-kind-of-insurance-fraud.

| have much, much information. | believe these are huge issue for Colorado consumers. | look
forward to doing whatever | can to aid you investigation.

Regards,
Peter Pfeiffer
30545 Roan Drive, Evergreen, CO 80439

720/314-6600 or 303/670-5174 (my longtime number which you do not have. | am terrible at
answering both phones. Please feel free to send an email with "call me" if you need me)

———————— Forwarded Message --------
Subject:Re: 128-0798-964
Date:Wed, 26 Feb 2025 14:11:04 -0700
From:Peter Pfeiffer <pcpfeiffer@msn.com>
To:Davesha Brown <davesha.brown.dSkg@statefarm.com>, Michele Vanags
<michele.vanags.r5d6@statefarm.com>

| almost never read such titled and unknown email. Please stop the extortion.

This will be forwarded to D.O.R.A. and the Jefferson County Sheriff's Department where there are
already open cases.

| do not and have never had a State Farm account or policy. Ms. Vanags cancelled it when caught
trespassing and eavesdropping without remorse. See my 12/14/24 letter sent both to her and State
Farm headquarters. You should have known when | was forced to contest the past non-refunded,
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Fwd: 128-0798-964; Insurance Complaint 298521

bogus charge you reference.

The D.O.R.A. investigator has been provided texts, email, and mailings. Please stop the harassment
immediately.

Thank you,

Peter C. Pfeiffer

On 2/26/2025 10:10 AM, Davesha Brown wrote:

Hello Peter,

My name is Davesha Brown. | am with the State Farm Billing department. | am reaching out in regards to the
concerns you shared with State Farm regarding you State Farm Billing account number 128-0798-964. Your inquiry
was referred to me since this matter falls within my area of responsibility. Your account was reviewed for a refund
and the following determination was made:

A payment in the amount of $212.63 was made on 11/22/2024 Paid by Visa, account number ending with 7745.

The payment of $212.63 was returned on 01/10/2025. There was only one payment made to the account and
because that payment was returned no money was collected and no refund is due.

| understand this can be a lot of information and want to allow you time to review. Please feel free to reach out to
me directly via email at davesha.brown.d9kg@statefarm.com with any additional questions or concerns you may
have .

Thank you for choosing State Farm.

Thank you,

Davesha Brown | D9KQ
Care Center Specialist Il ECC-SF Billing
Email: davesha.brown.d9kg@statefarm.com

o» StateFarmr
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